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GRIN Verlag Mai 2016, 2016. Taschenbuch. Book Condition:
Neu. 297x210x2 mm. This item is printed on demand - Print on
Demand Neuware - Seminar paper from the year 2009 in the
subject English Language and Literature Studies - Linguistics,
grade: 1,00, University of Kassel (Fachbereich für
Sprachwissenschaften), course: Visualization and Classroom
Observation, language: English, abstract: In this paper a
definition of the term bilingualism will be attempted, whereas
different points of views, e.g. the sociolinguistic and the
psycholinguistic point of view, will be implemented. What is
more, a closer look at the implementation of languages in the
human brain will be analyzed, in order to understand why
bilingualism as well as early bilingual teaching have a deep
impact on children's and student's language development. The
question 'what is bilingualism ' is not easy to answer. Even if we
study the great canon of literature on bilingualism, it leads to
the conclusion that there aren't any common definitions to be
found. Linguists have only agreed on the point that
bilingualism refers to an individual that has language skills in
two languages. However, linguists set the degree of
bilingualism differently: on the one hand, rudimentary
knowledge about a language seems enough, whereas...
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